
LAKE MARY CITY COMMISSION

Lake Mary City Hall
100 N. Country Club Road

Regular Meeting
AGENDA

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 04, 2014 7:00 PM

1. Call to Order

2. Moment of Silence

3. Pledge of Allegiance

4. Roll Call

5. Approval of Minutes: November 20, 2014

6. Special Presentations

7. Citizen Participation

8. Unfinished Business

A. Ordinance No. 1521 - Amending Chapter 150, Building Code and Chapter 152, 
Floodplain Management  - Second Reading (Public Hearing) (Bruce Paster, Public 
Works Director)

9. New Business



Page 2

10. Other Items for Commission Action

11. City Manager's Report

A. Items for Approval

a. Final Design Plan for SunRail Entry Feature Sign

b. Vehicle and Equipment Replacements for FY 2015; and New Vehicle for New 
Police Sergeant

c. Computer Purchases and Surplus

12. Mayor and Commissioners Report

13. City Attorney's Report

14. Adjournment

THE ORDER OF ITEMS ON THIS AGENDA IS SUBJECT TO CHANGE

Per the direction of the City Commission on December 7, 1989, this meeting will not extend 
beyond 11:00 P. M. unless there is unanimous consent of the Commission to extend the 
meeting.

PERSONS WITH DISABILITIES NEEDING ASSISTANCE TO PARTICIPATE IN ANY 
OF THESE PROCEEDINGS SHOULD CONTACT THE CITY ADA COORDINATOR 
AT LEAST 48 HOURS IN ADVANCE OF THE MEETING AT (407) 585-1424.

If a person decides to appeal any decision made by this Commission with respect to any 
matter considered at such meeting or hearing, he or she will need a record of the 
proceedings, and that, for such purpose, he or she may need to ensure that a verbatim 
record of the proceedings is made, which record includes the testimony and evidence upon 
which the appeal is to be based.  Per State Statute 286.0105.

NOTE:  If the Commission is holding a meeting/work session prior to the regular meeting, 
they will adjourn immediately following the meeting/work session to have dinner in the 
Conference Room.  The regular meeting will begin at 7:00 P. M. or as soon thereafter as 
possible. 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 1 

 

MINUTES OF THE LAKE MARY CITY COMMISSION MEETING held November 20, 1 
2014, 7:00 P.M., Lake Mary City Commission Chambers, 100 North Country Club Road, 2 
Lake Mary, Florida. 3 
 4 
 5 
1. Call to Order 6 
 7 
The meeting was called to order by Mayor David Mealor at 7:03 P.M. 8 
 9 
2. Moment of Silence 10 
 11 
3. Pledge of Allegiance 12 
 13 
4. Roll Call 14 
 15 
Mayor David Mealor     Jackie Sova, City Manager 16 
Commissioner Gary Brender   Carol Foster, City Clerk 17 
Deputy Mayor George Duryea   Dianne Holloway, Finance Director 18 
Commissioner Sidney Miller   John Omana, Community Dev. Dir. 19 
Commissioner Jo Ann Lucarelli   Steve Noto, Senior Planner 20 
       Bruce Paster, Public Works Director 21 
       Tom Tomerlin, Economic Dev. Mgr. 22 
       Bryan Nipe, Parks & Recreation Dir. 23 
       Wanda Broadway, HR Manager 24 
       Steve Bracknell, Police Chief 25 
       Joe Landreville, Deputy Fire Chief 26 
       Katie Reischmann, City Attorney 27 
       Mary Campbell, Deputy City Clerk 28 
 29 
5. Approval of Minutes:  November 6, 2014 30 
 31 
Motion was made by Commissioner Lucarelli to approve the minutes of the 32 
November 6, 2014, meeting, seconded by Deputy Mayor Duryea and motion 33 
carried unanimously. 34 
 35 
6. Special Presentations 36 
 37 
There were no special presentations at this time. 38 
 39 
7. Citizen Participation 40 
 41 
Mayor Mealor welcomed the gentleman that is representing Seminole State College as 42 
part of his college assignment.  He and any students are always welcome as are others.  43 
If any member of this Commission or the City Manager may be helpful do not hesitate to 44 
contact us. 45 
 46 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 2 

 

Mayor Mealor said he would like to do something out of the ordinary for him.  He felt a 1 
need to respond under Citizen Participation because there has been a mail out in this 2 
community and it is entitled “West Crystal Lake May Be in Danger”.  He distributed 3 
copies to the Commission (copy attached).  This mailing has gone out to specific 4 
residents of Lake Mary around Crystal Lake. 5 
 6 
Mayor Mealor said the beauty of our system is that anyone can speak out, anyone can 7 
raise any concern, and we welcome that.  However, he believed this mailer to be 8 
misleading to the residents around Crystal Lake.  He said what he wanted to do is to let 9 
you know in terms of the issue regarding the Lake Emma land use change.  While he 10 
didn’t know the individuals involved and had not gone to the website, he wanted to 11 
respond to this mailer on behalf of several of our citizens that have reached out to him 12 
and he has tried to get back with them.   13 
 14 
Mayor Mealor said this is the City process related to this particular item.  On October 15 
22, 2014, an application submitted by Mattamy Homes for a proposed future land use 16 
(FLU) change from office and restricted commercial to high density residential was 17 
reviewed and recommended for approval by the Planning & Zoning Board.  The 18 
Planning & Zoning Board is advisory only and does not represent final approval of any 19 
number of homes.  The final decision on the future land use change is made by the City 20 
Commission.  The City has not scheduled the future land use change for the City 21 
Commission as the developer has been advised by the City to meet with the 22 
surrounding residents to address their concerns.  The applicant has also submitted a 23 
planned unit development showing the layout of 81 units which has not been scheduled 24 
for public hearings due to a number of design issues that need to be addressed by the 25 
developer, including density.  The public hearings at the Planning & Zoning Board and 26 
the City Commission are open to public input. 27 
 28 
Mayor Mealor said as far as the Save Lake Mary Lakes.com flier, what you may wish to 29 
know about the information provided in the flier, the 40-acre tract on West Crystal Lake 30 
is designated as a nature preserve and cannot and will not be developed.  The nature 31 
preserve has a future land use designation of public/semi-public and is governed by a 32 
PUD agreement which prohibits development.  The nature preserve is not designated 33 
as office.  While we recognize a citizen’s right to reach out, all we want to do is let the 34 
residents that have been reached know that some of the information submitted is not as 35 
accurate as we would like to portray. 36 
 37 
No one came forward and citizen participation was closed. 38 
 39 
8. Unfinished Business 40 
 41 
There was no unfinished business at this time. 42 
 43 
9. New Business 44 
 45 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 3 

 

A. Ordinance No. 1521 – Amending Chapter 150, Building Code and Chapter 1 
152, Floodplain Management – First Reading (Public Hearing) (Bruce Paster, 2 
Public Works Director) 3 

 4 
The City Attorney read Ordinance No. 1521 by title only on first reading. 5 
 6 
Mr. Paster said FEMA requested that we clarify a few words in our ordinance.  There 7 
are some minor changes to clarify intent.  The other change that we added was since 8 
the Board of Adjustment has now merged with the Planning & Zoning Board, we took 9 
out references to the Board of Adjustment and changed that to Planning & Zoning 10 
Board in Chapter 152. 11 
 12 
Deputy Mayor Duryea said there are no changes other than a few minor word changes 13 
to clarify the intent as far as the management district goes. 14 
 15 
Mr. Paster said that was correct. 16 
 17 
Mayor Mealor asked if anyone wanted to speak in reference to Ordinance No. 1521.  No 18 
one came forward and the public hearing was closed. 19 
 20 
Motion was made by Commissioner Brender to approve Ordinance No. 1521 on 21 
first reading, seconded by Commissioner Lucarelli and motion carried by roll-call 22 
vote:  Commissioner Brender, Yes; Deputy Mayor Duryea, Yes; Commissioner 23 
Miller, Yes; Commissioner Lucarelli, Yes; Mayor Mealor, Yes. 24 
 25 

B. Resolution No. 953 – Amending FY 2014 Budget (Dianne Holloway, Finance 26 
Director) 27 

 28 
The City Attorney read Resolution No. 953 by title only. 29 
 30 
Ms. Holloway said as we approach closing out Fiscal Year 2014, we have a few items to 31 
clean up in our budget.  We need to increase revenues and expenditures in the General 32 
Fund for three police grants.  We had a $17,688 JAG for the police department training 33 
room rehab; a grant for the Trick or Tracker to purchase inventory equipment in the 34 
amount of $1,850; and we received $1,323 for the bullet proof vest partnership.  We 35 
need to reduce the Capital Outlay in the Recreation Impact Fee Fund.  The Heritage 36 
Park project is currently on hold until the Downtown construction slows to an acceptable 37 
level and can accommodate the disruption in that area.  We also need to increase the 38 
Capital Outlay in the Second Generation Sales Tax Fund for the Downtown right-of-way 39 
project.  Basically what we are doing is increasing the expenditures to finish using the 40 
Second Generation Sales Tax.  We need to increase our Health Insurance Fund by an 41 
additional $250,000 to cover unexpected medical claims in the health clinic operations. 42 
 43 
Ms. Holloway recommended the Commission adopt Resolution No. 953. 44 
 45 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 4 

 

Commissioner Lucarelli said regarding the additional $250,000 in costs for the clinic, 1 
she asked how we are doing financially with the clinic. 2 
 3 
Ms. Holloway said we are doing very well.  We just had some exceptionally high claims 4 
this year. 5 
 6 
Commissioner Brender asked if the unexpectedly high claims were against our 7 
background insurer or unexpectedly higher use of the clinic itself. 8 
 9 
Ms. Holloway said the majority of it is for our medical costs outside of the clinic. 10 
 11 
Motion was made by Deputy Mayor Duryea to approve Resolution No. 953, 12 
seconded by Commissioner Brender and motion carried by roll-call vote:  Deputy 13 
Mayor Duryea, Yes; Commissioner Miller, Yes; Commissioner Lucarelli, Yes; 14 
Commissioner Brender, Yes; Mayor Mealor, Yes. 15 
 16 
10. Other Items for Commission Action 17 
 18 
There were no other items to discuss at this time. 19 
 20 
11. City Manager’s Report 21 
 22 

A. Items for Approval 23 
1. Agreement with Advanced Data Processing, Inc. (Intermedix) for Medical 24 

Transport Billing 25 
 26 
Ms. Sova said this is our agreement with Advanced Data Processing, Inc. (Intermedix) 27 
for medical transport billing.  This is the firm that bills for our medical transports.  We 28 
have gone through this and it is time to update it.  It has been our provider since 29 
February 2005 and our current contract is about to expire.  With the execution of the 30 
attached agreement the fees are at 7.25% for net collections.  That is no change since 31 
January 2010.  The Medicaid beneficiary account billing is $13 per account which is no 32 
change since 2005.  The HIPAA compliance and Notice of Privacy Practices is $88 per 33 
month and no change since February 2005.  This is for a one-year term beginning 34 
January 1, 2015, with successive automatic one-year renewals unless either party 35 
provides the other party with written notice.  The annual contract cost to the City is 36 
about $45,000.   37 
 38 
Ms. Sova asked the Commission to approve the contract with ADPI (Intermedix) for 39 
transport billing. 40 
 41 
Commissioner Brender asked the 7.25% of net collections versus the $45,000. 42 
 43 
Ms. Holloway said the $45,000 is the annual cost.  When we are billed it is based on 44 
how many transports.  They bill X amount and collect X amount.  The 7.25 is the 45 
percentage of the amount they are collecting.  That plus the other components of the 46 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 5 

 

Medicaid beneficiary account, the HIPAA compliance, and notice mailing are the three 1 
components of the bill.   2 
 3 
Commissioner Brender asked if we were paying $45,000 plus all those other things. 4 
 5 
Ms. Holloway answered negatively. It’s those three components that make that up. 6 
 7 
Motion was made by Commissioner Brender to authorize the City Manager to 8 
execute agreement with Advanced Data Processing, Inc. (Intermedix) for medical 9 
transport billing, seconded by Commissioner Lucarelli and motion carried 10 
unanimously. 11 
 12 

2. SunRail Entry Feature Sign 13 
 14 
Ms. Sova said this is the SunRail entry feature sign.  We have enhancement funds to 15 
have a city entry feature sign at Palmetto and Lake Mary Boulevard. We have had 16 
concepts before the Commission before and we have redone those and Mr. Noto has a 17 
presentation. 18 
 19 
Mayor Mealor said there are four designs that will be presented.  Staff is seeking the 20 
Commission’s preference related to the preferred signage. 21 
 22 
Mr. Noto said it has been two years since we were before the Commission talking about 23 
this item. Staff originally prepared four designs in 2012 and after getting together 24 
internally and coordinating with FastSigns, we have come up with four designs based 25 
upon the sign at Trailhead Park at Rinehart Road and Lake Mary Boulevard. 26 
 27 
Mr. Noto said the funding for this sign is tied in with the FDOT SunRail enhancement 28 
funds.  We are getting close to the point where those funds are going to go away.  We 29 
have been trying to get a final date from FDOT as to when that will happen; however, 30 
we have been unable to get that date.  The original expiration was around this time this 31 
year (November/December 2014) but has now changed to spring of next year.   32 
 33 
Mr. Noto said we are looking at a sign that is roughly $14,000.  Depending on the 34 
direction we get this evening, we can move quickly to work with FastSigns to at least 35 
have the steel portion of the sign constructed and possibly get our hands on some of 36 
the stonework.  Construction of the sign won’t occur until a later date because we have 37 
a number of capital projects happening at the corner of Palmetto and Lake Mary 38 
Boulevard such as the traffic signal, turn lane, lift station and other improvements. 39 
 40 
Mr. Noto showed a base sample of a sign on the overhead that shows the typical base 41 
of the sign, it is 10’ X 15’ and what we have asked FastSigns to provide were three 42 
other options that were a little bit different. 43 
 44 
Mayor Mealor asked if the primary difference was the width. 45 
 46 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 6 

 

Mr. Noto said that was correct.  They also provided two other examples that show the 1 
seal as part of the base.  The cost will go up a little bit with that because they have to 2 
add the stone around the seal.  In this option you can see how the base lines up with 3 
the edge of the metal.  The last option the base comes out roughly 2-1/2 feet on either 4 
side.  They also provided an image showing what the sign would look like at the corner.  5 
It is roughly to scale and you can see Station House in the background and the base of 6 
the future traffic signal.  It would not go exactly where it is shown because the turn lane 7 
does not exist and there is some work that is going to be done on the pond.  It will be 8 
pushed back a little more to the west.  The intent would be to avoid conflict with the 9 
traffic signal post.  We don’t want that to block a large portion of the sign. 10 
 11 
Mr. Noto showed samples of the stone.  He showed a sample of the stone that is shown 12 
on the graphics and is the stone that has been used at all the WaWa gas stations 13 
around town.  The other option is a bit darker and is staff’s preferred option and the 14 
same price point.  We think this would hold up a lot better in the long run because it’s 15 
not as light.  With the reclaimed irrigation in that area this would be a better option. 16 
 17 
Mayor Mealor asked if there was any objection to staff preference for the cultured stone.   18 
 19 
There were no objections from the Board. 20 
 21 
Mayor Mealor said staff had direction to go with the second option. 22 
 23 
Commissioner Brender asked the plan for Palmetto.  There was talk about four-laning 24 
Palmetto, talk about putting in turn lanes. 25 
 26 
Mr. Noto said Public Works is currently working on a design to add one turn lane 27 
southbound so folks can go to the west.  Right now there is not enough right-of-way to 28 
do anything more than that.  The constraint is mainly on the east side of the road.  29 
Widening of Palmetto will occur as redevelopment occurs over time.  The signal will 30 
likely be in within the next two to three months.  We will take pause since there is so 31 
much construction activity in that area of town then Public Works will work on adding the 32 
turn lane, adding sidewalks, adjusting the pond, and adding a lift station. 33 
 34 
Deputy Mayor Duryea asked Mr. Noto if they showed him any with rounded tops.  He 35 
thought that would go more with the one on Lake Mary Boulevard. 36 
 37 
Mr. Noto said these are the only options we received.  That doesn’t mean that these are 38 
not customizable.  Right now there is a plan for a gap running front to back for flowers 39 
and things of that nature.  We anticipate doing a miniature plaza for a base so it is more 40 
than just a sign planted on grass.  If the Commission wants to see more rounding we 41 
could work with the contractor on that. 42 
 43 
Mayor Mealor suggested looking at the monument feature at the corner of Rinehart and 44 
Lake Mary Boulevard, which we get great compliments on and it is featured frequently 45 
in publications, and see if we can match the top of that to the top of this. 46 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 7 

 

 1 
Commissioner Brender preferred the seal being in the base rather than floating in the 2 
middle.  With the seal being round would like to explore making the top a little less 3 
squared off. 4 
 5 
Mr. Nipe said the image shown is emulated off of the sign at Rinehart.  The top is 6 
squared off.   If the Commission desires we could ask them to look at something 7 
different.  The only thing that changes is Downtown Lake Mary.  The symbol is forward 8 
rather than back and the stonework is different.  We have more of a Grecian style 9 
column at Rinehart. 10 
 11 
Mayor Mealor said Commissioner Brender has talked about the seal being anchored 12 
into the base.  He asked if there was any objection to that. 13 
 14 
Commissioner Lucarelli said it looks like the one at Rinehart is down and is not hanging 15 
up.  Her whole thing is for consistency is making it look like that one. 16 
 17 
There was no objection from the Board. 18 
 19 
Mayor Mealor asked staff to bring back a design that matches as closely as possible the 20 
concept of Rinehart/Lake Mary Boulevard with the fact that we are using a different 21 
stone as opposed to brick. 22 
 23 
Commissioner Brender said that is assuming we don’t want to go with anything rounded 24 
because the one at Lake Mary Boulevard is rectangular.  He agreed consistency was 25 
important. 26 
 27 
Mayor Mealor said we are looking for consistency with the exception of the stone. 28 
 29 
Mr. Noto said we will have that for the next meeting. 30 
 31 

3. Appointment to Metroplan’s Citizen Advisory Committee 32 
 33 
Ms. Sova said at the last meeting the Commission directed staff to solicit a resident to 34 
represent the City on the Metroplan Citizen Advisory Committee and former 35 
commissioner Jan Jernigan would be interested in serving in that capacity.  She has 36 
been on their Municipal Advisory Committee in the past.  She asked the Commission to 37 
appoint Jan Jernigan to the Metroplan Citizen Advisory Committee. 38 
 39 
Motion was made by Commissioner Brender to appoint Jan Jernigan to the 40 
Metroplan Citizen Advisory Committee, seconded by Commissioner Lucarelli and 41 
motion carried unanimously. 42 
 43 
Ms. Sova said all non-emergency offices will be closed next Thursday and Friday in 44 
observance of Thanksgiving.  Solid waste collection for Thanksgiving Day will be 45 
provided on the makeup day of Saturday, November 29th.   46 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 8 

 

 1 
Ms. Sova said she has some personnel changes.  Police Officer Matt Schaffer has been 2 
promoted to Sergeant effective the first of the month.  After more than 28 years with the 3 
City Lt. Terry Salsbury in the Fire Department will be retiring on December 5th.  There is 4 
a reception for him tomorrow from 2:00 P.M. to 4:00 P.M. in the training room at 5 
Wallace Court. 6 
 7 
Ms. Sova said a round of applause to our SWAT team who recently competed in the 8 
32nd Annual SWAT Roundup International.  The guys gave it their all for five days and 9 
overcame many obstacles and arduous tasks and after competing against teams from 10 
all over the world their hard work paid off with a final ranking of 32 out of 51. 11 
 12 
Ms. Sova said WineART Wednesday featuring the DailyCity.Com Food Truck Bazaar 13 
will be held December 3rd from 5:00 P.M. to 9:00 P.M. in Central Park. 14 
 15 
Ms. Sova reminded everyone that Holiday in the Park is Friday, December 5th, from 16 
6:00 P.M. to 8:00 P.M. with tree lighting at 6:30 P.M. followed by Mr. and Mrs. Claus 17 
coming at 6:45 P.M. on the fire truck.  There will be face painting, kids’ games and 18 
prizes, and a children’s train.  There will be free cookies given out to those who bring a 19 
canned good or unwrapped toy to donate to the City’s holiday drive.  This year we have 20 
an expanding music and light show. 21 
 22 
Ms. Sova said the holiday toy and food drive gets underway tomorrow.  You can drop 23 
off new unwrapped toys and unopened non-perishable food items at the boxes at city 24 
hall, police department, fire stations, and our Municipal Services Complex through 25 
December 12th.  You can contact Human Resources at 407-585-1424 for more 26 
information. 27 
 28 
Ms. Sova said we will cancel the first meeting in January due to its falling on New Year’s 29 
Day. 30 
 31 
Ms. Sova said Bryan Nipe has received the Parks & Recreation Accreditation plaque 32 
and would come up and show it to the Commission. 33 
 34 
Mr. Nipe said he was extremely proud and honored to present this tonight.  We are one 35 
of only 26 accredited national agencies in the state and just over 130 in the nation.  That 36 
is for public agencies such as cities, counties, and the military.  We were accredited with 37 
a naval base in Georgia this year.  We are very proud of this.  It was a huge team effort, 38 
totally inclusive, and we included all the departments.  We appreciate everybody’s time 39 
and the City Manager and Commission’s support. 40 
 41 
Mayor Mealor said there were more than 405 municipalities in the State of Florida and 42 
we are in the top 5%.  What a compliment to Mr. Nipe and his team’s hard work. 43 
 44 
Ms. Sova said on some of the Parks & Recreation trucks they have the accreditation 45 
decal. 46 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 9 

 

 1 
Mayor Mealor said we are honored to have two of the newest elected members of a 2 
Central Florida community.  We have the Mayor and the newest Commissioner for the 3 
City of Debary.  Their SunRail station has had such an impact on the region.   4 
 5 
12. Mayor and Commissioners’ Reports (4) 6 
 7 
Mayor Mealor had no report at this time. 8 
 9 
Commissioner Lucarelli said she enjoyed listening to our Mayor give one of the better 10 
presentations at PBAS last week.   11 
 12 
Commissioner Lucarelli said she attended the Senior Intervention Group meeting.  The 13 
big thing Zach (Hudson) was asking for is if you know someone who is in need of a 14 
frozen turkey or a hot meal option for the elderly.  We are working on delivering the 15 
frozen turkeys Monday and on Wednesday evening will be delivering the hot meals.  16 
We have a lot of meals and turkeys being donated.  We need to know if there is 17 
anybody out there in need that we don’t know about yet and get them on our list.  That 18 
is a countywide effort. 19 
 20 
Commissioner Lucarelli said she attended CLEO and attended a portion of the RPA 21 
meeting.  She said Mr. Omana finished up for her because she had to leave for a work 22 
meeting.  Nothing yet on Lake Mary coming forward but there is a project with the 23 
charter school where the old theater used to be by the entrance to the college that will 24 
eventually be coming before the RPA and CRA Boards for approval.  She will keep the 25 
Commission posted on that. 26 
 27 
Mayor Mealor said the Senior Intervention Group is a remarkable service to the greater 28 
community.  It is the activity that has helped Officer Hudson receive the National Police 29 
Officer of the Year recognition.  Paster Montgomery serves as the chaplain so it might 30 
be appropriate to reach out to him. 31 
 32 
Commissioner Brender said it is our City Attorney’s birthday and extended birthday 33 
wishes. 34 
 35 
Deputy Mayor Duryea said he was excited about what’s going on outside and was sure 36 
it is going to be better than it was last year and the year before.  It’s nice. 37 
 38 
Mayor Mealor said the December 5th event is going to be very special.  The City did 39 
extend an invitation to our County Chairman Commissioner Carey.  This is part of her 40 
district and hopefully her schedule will allow her to join us. 41 
 42 
Commissioner Miller said he would like to comment on the dedication of the Veterans’ 43 
Park in Timacuan.  Commissioner Brender was honored—he was our veteran.  The 44 
Mayor, Thom Greene, and City Manager were there.  Our Mayor did us proud and gave 45 
a magnificent speech about veterans and the dedication of the park.  Our role in that 46 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 10 

 

was as the homeowners’ association at Timacuan was deciding to do this and getting 1 
ready to spend all that money, they discovered they didn’t own the land but the City did.  2 
The City gave them the land to do the park. 3 
 4 
Commissioner Miller said he went for his training for the Municipal Advisory Committee 5 
for Metroplan Orlando.  Harry Barley and Virginia Whittington spent over an hour with 6 
him and he was somewhat surprised.  The Municipal Advisory Committee was formed 7 
after their light rail attempt was started and two mayors were very upset that they did 8 
not have a vote on Metroplan Orlando and light rail was going to come through their 9 
cities.  In order to give them a voice they created the Municipal Advisory Committee.  It 10 
consists of cities up to 47,000 in population all have a seat on the Metroplan Orlando 11 
Board of Directors.  If you have a lower population than that you don’t get a seat.  That 12 
represents 22 cities and 309,000 people.  There are 22 people that can belong to that 13 
committee but only 17 permit and we are one of the ones that sit on that.  The chair of 14 
that committee has a seat on the board.  All of that is changing.  The Metroplan Orlando 15 
Board of Directors is 19 people by statute and has now been changed to 25, so there 16 
will be changes on who has seats on the Metroplan Orlando. 17 
 18 
Mayor Mealor said they appreciated Commissioner Miller’s willingness to serve on that 19 
committee and believed his expertise is going to be invaluable as we move forward. 20 
 21 
Mayor Mealor said tomorrow the Seminole County Legislative Delegation will hold their 22 
public hearings and Commissioner Lucarelli will be presenting.  Anybody who has a 23 
request or feels there is a need for legislative support it is imperative that a public 24 
hearing take place.  That is available to our community tomorrow between 9:00 A.M. 25 
and 1:00 P.M. 26 
 27 
Commissioner Miller asked Mayor Mealor if he knew how that meeting was structured 28 
because the notification says 9:00 A.M. to 1:00 P.M.  He asked if that was something 29 
you should go to and expect to be there four hours. 30 
 31 
Mayor Mealor said not at all.  He said he would speak for himself as a former chair of 32 
that legislative delegation that the last thing you would want is an extended hearing.  33 
There are far more requests than there will ever be ways to meet those so less is more.  34 
Chairman Simmons asked that information be submitted no later than Wednesday 35 
evening so they can compile that.  If you have a need or a wish to speak for that group, 36 
simply go at 9:00 A.M., look at the timeframe and they will give you a guesstimate as to 37 
when it is and you can come back or present and leave.  It is a very important activity in 38 
terms of the fact that a legislative body cannot respond to something at the last moment 39 
had there not been some kind of public recognition or input. 40 
 41 
13. City Attorney’s Report 42 
 43 
Ms. Reischmann had no report at this time. 44 
 45 
14. Adjournment 46 



 

CITY COMMISSION 
November 20, 2014 - 11 

 

 1 
There being no further business, the meeting adjourned at 7:43 P.M. 2 
 3 
 4 
 5 
_______________________   ___________________________ 6 
    David J. Mealor, Mayor    Mary Campbell, Deputy City Clerk 7 
 8 
 9 
 10 
ATTEST: 11 
 12 
 13 
 14 
_______________________ 15 
 Carol A. Foster, City Clerk 16 



MEMORANDUM

DATE: December 4, 2014

TO: Mayor and City Commission

FROM: Danielle Koury, P.E., Stormwater Engineer

THRU: Bruce Paster, Public Works Director

VIA: Jackie Sova, City Manager

SUBJECT: Ordinance No. 1521 – Amending Chapter 150, Building Code and Chapter 
152, Floodplain Management 

DISCUSSION: Changes are required to be made by the Federal Emergency 
Management Agency (FEMA) to the City’s adopted Floodplain Management Ordinance, 
previously adopted by the City on May 17, 2012.

Attached is the revised Chapter 150, Building Code and Chapter 152, Floodplain 
Management Ordinance. The primary reason for the revisions is to modify and/or add 
wording to clarify intent.  Additionally, Section 152.07 is being amended to reflect that 
the Planning and Zoning Board will hear and decide on requests for appeals and 
requests for variances rather than the Board of Adjustment.  As you will recall, you 
previously merged the Board of Adjustment with the Planning and Zoning Board.  

RECOMMENDATION:  City Commission adopt Ordinance No. 1521 amending Chapter 
150, Building Code and Chapter 152, Floodplain Management Ordinance.



1

ORDINANCE NO. 1521

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF LAKE MARY, FLORIDA, AMENDING 
CHAPTER 150 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES ENTITLED “BUILDING 
CODE” AND CHAPTER 152 ENTITLED “FLOODPLAIN MANAGEMENT” TO
MEET REQUIREMENTS OF THE FEDERAL EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT 
AGENCY (FEMA); PROVIDING FOR THE PLANNING AND ZONING BOARD 
TO HANDLE VARIANCES AND APPEALS FROM CHAPTER 150; PROVIDING 
FOR SEVERABILITY, CODIFICATIONS AND EFFECTIVE DATE.  

WHEREAS, the Legislature of the State of Florida has, in Chapter 166, Florida 
Statutes, conferred upon local governments the authority to adopt regulations designed 
to promote the public health, safety, and general welfare of its citizenry; and

 WHEREAS, the Federal Emergency Management Agency has identified special 
flood hazard areas within the boundaries of the City of Lake Mary, Florida and such 
areas may be subject to periodic inundation which may result in loss of life and property, 
health and safety hazards, disruption of commerce and governmental services, 
extraordinary public expenditures for flood protection and relief, and impairment of the 
tax base, all of which adversely affect the public health, safety and general welfare, and

 WHEREAS, the City of Lake Mary, Florida was accepted for participation in the 
National Flood Insurance Program on March 18, 1980 and the City Commission desires 
to continue to meet the requirements of Title 44 Code of Federal Regulations, Sections 
59 and 60, necessary for such participation; and

 WHEREAS, Chapter 553, Florida Statutes, was adopted by the Florida Legislature 
to provide a mechanism for the uniform adoption, updating, amendment, interpretation 
and enforcement of a state building code, called the Florida Building Code; and

 WHEREAS, section 553.73(5), Florida Statutes, allows adoption of local 
administrative amendments to the Florida Building Code to implement the National 
Flood Insurance Program; and

 WHEREAS, the City Commission combined the duties of the Board of Adjustment 
with those of the Planning and Zoning Board making it necessary to amend the code.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COMMISSION:

SECTION 1.  That the Code of Ordinances is hereby amended as follows:

§ 150.03  ADOPTION OF STANDARD CODES

 (f)  Section 107



2

107.6.1 Building permits issued on the basis of an affidavit. Pursuant to the 
requirements of federal regulation for participation in the National Flood Insurance 
Program (44 C.F.R. Sections 59 and 60), the authority granted to the Building Official to 
issue permits, to rely on inspections, and to accept plans and construction documents 
on the basis of affidavits and plans submitted pursuant to Section 105.14 and Section 
107.6 shall not extend to the flood load and flood resistance construction requirements 
of the Florida Building Code.

§ 152.01 GENERAL PROVISIONS.

 (A)  Title. These regulations shall be known as the Floodplain Management 
Ordinance of the City of Lake Mary, Florida, hereinafter referred to as "this chapter.”

 
 (B)  Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall apply to all development that is 

wholly within or partially within any flood hazard area, including but not limited to the 
subdivision of land; filling, grading, and other site improvements and utility installations; 
construction, alteration, remodeling, enlargement, improvement, replacement, repair, 
relocation or demolition of buildings, structures, and facilities that are exempt from the 
Florida Building Code; placement, installation, or replacement of manufactured homes 
and manufactured buildings; installation or replacement of tanks; placement of 
recreational vehicles; installation of swimming pools; and any other development.

 (C)  Intent. The purposes of this chapter and the flood load and flood resistant 
construction requirements of the Florida Building Code are to establish minimum 
requirements to safeguard the public health, safety, and general welfare and to 
minimize public and private losses due to flooding through regulation of development in 
flood hazard areas to:

 (1)  Minimize unnecessary disruption of commerce, access and public service 
during times of flooding;

 (2)  Require the use of appropriate construction practices in order to prevent or 
minimize future flood damage;

 (3)  Manage filling, grading, dredging, mining, paving, excavation, drilling 
operations, storage of equipment or materials, and other development which may 
increase flood damage or erosion potential;

 (4)  Manage the alteration of flood hazard areas, watercourses, and shorelines to 
minimize the impact of development on the natural and beneficial functions of the 
floodplain;

 (5)  Minimize damage to public and private facilities and utilities;
 (6)  Help maintain a stable tax base by providing for the sound use and 

development of flood hazard areas;
 (7)  Minimize the need for future expenditure of public funds for flood control 

projects and response to and recovery from flood events; and
 (8)  Meet the requirements of the National Flood Insurance Program for community 

participation as set forth in the Title 44 Code of Federal Regulations, Section 59.22.



3

  (D)  Coordination with the Florida Building Code. This chapter is intended to be 
administered and enforced in conjunction with the Florida Building Code. Where cited, 
ASCE 24 refers to the edition of the standard that is referenced by the Florida Building 
Code.

  (E)  Warning. The degree of flood protection required by this chapter and the 
Florida Building Code, as amended by this community, is considered the minimum 
reasonable for regulatory purposes and is based on scientific and engineering 
considerations. Larger floods can and will occur. Flood heights may be increased by 
man-made or natural causes. This chapter does not imply that land outside of mapped 
special flood hazard areas, or that uses permitted within such flood hazard areas, will 
be free from flooding or flood damage. The flood hazard areas and base flood 
elevations contained in the flood insurance study and shown on flood insurance rate 
maps and the requirements of Title 44 Code of Federal Regulations, Sections 59 and 60 
may be revised by the Federal Emergency Management Agency, requiring this 
community to revise these regulations to remain eligible for participation in the National 
Flood Insurance Program. No guaranty of vested use, existing use, or future use is 
implied or expressed by compliance with this chapter.

 (F)  Disclaimer of Liability. This chapter shall not create liability on the part of the 
City Commission of the City of Lake Mary, Florida or by any officer or employee thereof 
for any flood damage that results from reliance on this chapter or any administrative 
decision lawfully made thereunder.

§ 152.02 APPLICABILITY.

(A) General. Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a specific 
requirement, the specific requirement shall be applicable.

(B) Areas to which this chapter applies. This chapter shall apply to all flood 
hazard areas within the City of Lake Mary, Florida, as established in § 152.02(C) 
of this chapter.

 (C)  Basis for establishing flood hazard areas. The Flood Insurance Study for 
Seminole County, Florida and Incorporated Areas dated September 28, 2007, and all 
subsequent amendments and revisions, and the accompanying flood insurance rate 
maps (FIRM), and all subsequent amendments and revisions to such maps, are 
adopted by reference as a part of this chapter and shall serve as the minimum basis for 
establishing flood hazard areas. Studies and maps that establish flood hazard areas are 
on file at:

 Seminole County Public Library
 Lake Mary Branch
 580 Greenway Blvd
 Lake Mary, FL 32746



4

 (D)  Submission of additional data to establish flood hazard areas. To establish 
flood hazard areas and base flood elevations, pursuant to § 152.05 of this chapter, the 
Floodplain Administrator may require submission of additional data. Where field 
surveyed topography prepared by a Florida licensed professional surveyor or digital 
topography accepted by the community indicates that ground elevations:

 (1)  Are below the closest applicable base flood elevation, even in areas not 
delineated as a special flood hazard area on a FIRM, the area shall be considered as a 
flood hazard area and subject to the requirements of this chapter and, as applicable, the 
requirements of the Florida Building Code.

 (2)  Are above the closest applicable base flood elevation, the area shall be 
regulated as special flood hazard area unless the applicant obtains a Letter of Map 
Change that removes the area from the special flood hazard area.

 (E)  Other laws. The provisions of this chapter shall not be deemed to nullify any 
provisions of local, state or federal law.

 (F)  Abrogation and greater restrictions. This chapter supersedes any ordinance in 
effect for management of development in flood hazard areas. However, it is not 
intended to repeal or abrogate any existing ordinances including but not limited to land 
development regulations, zoning ordinances, or stormwater management regulations 
or the Florida Building Code. In the event of a conflict between this chapter and any 
other ordinance, the more restrictive shall govern. This chapter shall not impair any 
deed restriction, covenant or easement, but any land that is subject to such interests 
shall also be governed by this chapter.

 (G)  Interpretation. In the interpretation and application of this chapter, all provisions 
shall be:

 (1)  Considered as minimum requirements;
 (2)  Liberally construed in favor of the governing body; and
 (3)  Deemed neither to limit nor repeal any other powers granted under state 

statutes.

§ 152.03 DUTIES AND POWERS OF THE FLOODPLAIN ADMINISTRATOR.

 (A)  Designation. The Public Works Director is designated as the Floodplain 
Administrator. The Floodplain Administrator may delegate performance of certain duties 
to other employees.

 (B)  General. The Floodplain Administrator is authorized and directed to administer 
and enforce the provisions of this chapter. The Floodplain Administrator shall have the 
authority to render interpretations of this chapter consistent with the intent and purpose 
of this chapter and may establish policies and procedures in order to clarify the 
application of its provisions. Such interpretations, policies, and procedures shall not 



5

have the effect of waiving requirements specifically provided in this chapter without the 
granting of a variance pursuant to § 152.07 of this chapter.

 (C)  Applications and permits. The Floodplain Administrator, in coordination with 
other pertinent offices of the community, shall:

 (1)  Review applications and plans to determine whether proposed new 
development will be located in flood hazard areas;

 (2)  Review applications for modification of any existing development in flood 
hazard areas for compliance with the requirements of this chapter;

 (3)  Interpret flood hazard area boundaries where such interpretation is necessary 
to determine the exact location of boundaries; a person contesting the determination 
shall have the opportunity to appeal the interpretation;

 (4)  Provide available flood elevation and flood hazard information;
 (5)  Determine whether additional flood hazard data shall be obtained from other 

sources or shall be developed by an applicant;
 (6)  Review applications to determine whether proposed development will be 

reasonably safe from flooding;
 (7)  Issue floodplain development permits or approvals for development other than 

buildings and structures that are subject to the Florida Building Code, including 
buildings, structures and facilities exempt from the Florida Building Code, when 
compliance with this chapter is demonstrated, or disapprove the same in the event of 
noncompliance;

 (8)  Coordinate with and provide comments to the Building Official to assure that 
applications, plan reviews, and inspections for buildings and structures in flood hazard 
areas comply with the applicable provisions of this chapter.

 (D)  Determinations for existing buildings and structures Substantial 
improvements and substantial damage determinations. For applications for building 
permits to improve buildings and structures, including alterations, movement, 
enlargement, replacement, repair, change of occupancy, additions, rehabilitations, 
renovations, and any other improvement of or work on such buildings and structures, 
the Floodplain Administrator, in coordination with the Building Official, shall:

 (1)  Estimate the market value, or require the applicant to obtain an appraisal of the 
market value prepared by a qualified independent appraiser, of the building or structure 
before the start of construction of the proposed work. In the case of repair, the market 
value of the building or structure shall be the market value before the damage occurred 
and before any repairs are made;

 (2)  Compare the cost to perform the improvement, the cost to repair a damaged 
building to its pre-damaged condition, or the combined costs of improvements and 
repairs, if applicable, to the market value of the building or structure;

 (3)  Determine and document whether the proposed work constitutes substantial 
improvement or repair of substantial damage. The determination requires evaluation of 
previous permits issued for improvements and repairs as specified in the definition of 
"substantial improvement"; and



6

 (4)  Notify the applicant if it is determined that the work constitutes substantial 
improvement or repair of substantial damage and that compliance with the flood 
resistant provisions of the Florida Building Code and this chapter is required.

 (E)  Modifications of the strict application of the requirements of the Florida 
Building Code. The Floodplain Administrator shall review requests submitted to the 
Building Official that seek approval to modify the strict application of the flood load and 
flood resistant construction requirements of the Florida Building Code to determine 
whether such requests require the granting of a variance pursuant to § 152.07 of this 
chapter.

 (F)  Notices and orders. The Floodplain Administrator shall coordinate with 
appropriate local agencies for the issuance of all necessary notices or orders to ensure 
compliance with this ordinance.

 (G)  Inspections. The Floodplain Administrator shall make the required inspections 
as specified in § 152.06 of this chapter for development that is not subject to the Florida 
Building Code, including buildings, structures and facilities exempt from the Florida 
Building Code. The Floodplain Administrator shall inspect flood hazard areas to 
determine if development is undertaken without issuance of a permit.

 (H)  Other duties of the Floodplain Administrator. The Floodplain Administrator 
shall have other duties, including but not limited to:

 (1)  Establish, in coordination with the Building Official, procedures for administering
and documenting determinations of substantial improvement and substantial damage 
made pursuant to § 152.04 of this chapter;

 (2)  Require that applicants proposing alteration of a watercourse notify adjacent 
communities and the Florida Division of Emergency Management, State Floodplain 
Management Office, and submit copies of such notifications to the Federal Emergency 
Management Agency (FEMA);

 (3)  Require applicants who submit hydrologic and hydraulic engineering analyses 
to support permit applications to submit to FEMA the data and information necessary to 
maintain the flood insurance rate maps if the analyses propose to change base flood 
elevations, flood hazard area boundaries, or floodway designations. Such submissions 
shall be made within six months of such data becoming available;

 (4)  Review required design certifications and documentation of elevations specified 
by this chapter and the Florida Building Code and this chapter to determine that such 
certifications and documentations are complete; and

 (5)  Notify the Federal Emergency Management Agency when the corporate 
boundaries of the City of Lake Mary, Florida are modified.

 (I)  Floodplain management records. Regardless of any limitation on the period 
required for retention of public records, the Floodplain Administrator shall maintain and 
permanently keep and make available for public inspection all records that are 
necessary for the administration of this chapter and the flood resistant construction 



7

requirements of the Florida Building Code, including flood insurance rate maps; letters 
of change; records of issuance of permits and denial of permits; determinations of 
whether proposed work constitutes substantial improvement or repair of substantial 
damage; required design certifications and documentation of elevations specified by the 
Florida Building Code and this chapter; notifications to adjacent communities, FEMA, 
and the state related to alterations of watercourses; assurances that the flood carrying 
capacity of altered watercourses will be maintained; documentation related to appeals 
and variances, including justification for issuance or denial; and records of enforcement 
actions taken pursuant to this chapter and the flood resistant construction requirements 
of the Florida Building Code. These records shall be available for public inspection at:

 
 Municipal Services Complex
 911 Wallace Ct.
 Lake Mary, FL 32746

§ 152.04 PERMITS.

 (A)  Permits required. Any owner or owner's authorized agent (hereinafter 
"applicant") who intends to undertake any development activity within the scope of this 
chapter including buildings, structures and facilities exempt from the Florida Building 
Code, which is wholly within or partially within any flood hazard area shall first make 
application to the Floodplain Administrator, and the Building Official if applicable, and 
shall obtain the required permit(s) and approval(s). No such permit or approval shall be 
issued until compliance with the requirements of this chapter and all other applicable 
codes and regulations has been satisfied.

 (B)  Floodplain development permits or approvals. Floodplain development 
permits or approvals shall be issued pursuant to this chapter for any development 
activities not subject to the requirements of the Florida Building Code, including 
buildings, structures and facilities exempt from the Florida Building Code. Depending on 
the nature and extent of proposed development that includes a building or structure, the 
Floodplain Administrator may determine that a floodplain development permit or 
approval is required in addition to a building permit.

 (C)  Buildings, structures and facilities exempt from the Florida Building Code. 
Pursuant to the requirements of federal regulation for participation in the National Flood 
Insurance Program (44 C.F.R. Sections 59 and 60), floodplain development permits or 
approvals shall be required for the following buildings, structures and facilities that are 
exempt from the Florida Building Code and any further exemptions provided by law, 
which are subject to the requirements of this chapter:

 (1)  Railroads and ancillary facilities associated with the railroad;
 (2)  Nonresidential farm buildings on farms, as provided in F.S. § 604.50;
 (3)  Temporary buildings or sheds used exclusively for construction purposes;
 (4)  Mobile or modular structures used as temporary offices;



8

  (5)  Those structures or facilities of electric utilities, as defined in F.S. § 366.02, 
which are directly involved in the generation, transmission, or distribution of electricity;

 (6)  Chickees constructed by the Miccosukee Tribe of Indians of Florida or the 
Seminole Tribe of Florida. As used in this paragraph, the term "chickee" means an 
open-sided wooden hut that has a thatched roof of palm or palmetto or other traditional 
materials, and that does not incorporate any electrical, plumbing, or other non-wood 
features;

 (7)  Family mausoleums not exceeding 250 square feet in area which are 
prefabricated and assembled on site or preassembled and delivered on site and have 
walls, roofs, and a floor constructed of granite, marble, or reinforced concrete;

 (8)  Temporary housing provided by the Department of Corrections to any prisoner 
in the state correctional system; and

 (9)  Structures identified in F.S. § 553.73(10)(k), are not exempt from the Florida 
Building Code if such structures are located in flood hazard areas established on flood 
insurance rate maps.

 (D)  Application for a permit or approval. To obtain a floodplain development 
permit or approval the applicant shall first file an application in writing on a form 
furnished by the community. The information provided shall:

 (1)  Identify and describe the development to be covered by the permit or approval;
 (2)  Describe the land on which the proposed development is to be conducted by 

legal description, street address or similar description that will readily identify and 
definitively locate the site;

 (3)  Indicate the use and occupancy for which the proposed development is 
intended;

 (4)  Be accompanied by a site plan or construction documents as specified in 
§ 152.05 of this chapter;

 (5)  State the valuation of the proposed work;
 (6)  Be signed by the applicant or the applicant's authorized agent; and
 (7)  Give such other data and information as required by the Floodplain 

Administrator.

 (E)  Validity of permit or approval. The issuance of a floodplain development permit 
or approval pursuant to this chapter shall not be construed to be a permit for, or
approval of, any violation of this chapter, the Florida Building Codes, or any other 
ordinance of this community. The issuance of permits based on submitted applications, 
construction documents, and information shall not prevent the Floodplain Administrator 
from requiring the correction of errors and omissions.

 (F)  Expiration. A floodplain development permit or approval shall become invalid 
unless the work authorized by such permit is commenced within 180 days after its 
issuance, or if the work authorized is suspended or abandoned for a period of 180 days 
after the work commences. Extensions for periods of not more than 180 days each shall 
be requested in writing and justifiable cause shall be demonstrated.



9

 (G)  Suspension or revocation. The Floodplain Administrator is authorized to 
suspend or revoke a floodplain development permit or approval if the permit was issued 
in error, on the basis of incorrect, inaccurate or incomplete information, or in violation of 
this chapter or any other ordinance, regulation or requirement of this community.

 (H)  Other permits required. Floodplain development permits and building permits 
shall include a condition that all other applicable state or federal permits be obtained 
before commencement of the permitted development, including but not limited to the 
following:

 (1)  The St. John's River Water Management District; F.S. § 373.036;
 (2)  Florida Department of Health for onsite sewage treatment and disposal 

systems; F.S.§ 381.0065, and Chapter 64E-6, F.A.C.;
 (3)  Florida Department of Environmental Protection for activities subject to the 

Joint Coastal Permit; F.S. § 161.055; and
 (4)  Florida Department of Environmental Protection for activities that affect 

wetlands and alter surface water flows, in conjunction with the U.S. Army Corps of 
Engineers; Section 404 of the Clean Water Act.

 (5)  Federal permits and approval.

§ 152.05 SITE PLANS AND CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS.

 (A)  Information for development in flood hazard areas.

 (1)  The site plan or construction documents for any development subject to the 
requirements of this chapter shall be drawn to scale and shall include, as applicable to 
the proposed development:

 (a)  Delineation of flood hazard areas, floodway boundaries and flood zone(s), 
base flood elevation(s), and ground elevations if necessary for review of the proposed 
development;

 (b)  Where flood hazard areas, base flood elevations, or floodway data are not 
included on the FIRM or in the flood insurance study, they shall be established in 
accordance with division (B) of this section § 152.05(B)(2) or (3) of this chapter;

 (c)  Where the parcel on which the proposed development will take place will 
have more than 50 lots or is larger than five acres and the base flood elevations are not 
included on the FIRM or in the flood insurance study, such elevations shall be 
established in accordance with § 152.05(B)(1) or (2) of this chapter;

 (d)  Location of the proposed activity and proposed structures, and locations of 
existing buildings and structures;

 (e)  Minimum finished floor elevation set to at least 1.5 feet above the 100-year 
flood elevation. It is the responsibility of the developer to insure that all finished floor 
elevations are set to 1.5 feet above the 100-year flood elevation;

 (f)  Location, extent, amount, and proposed final grades of any filling, grading, or 
excavation;



10

 (g)  Where the placement of fill is proposed, the amount, type, and source of fill 
material; compaction specifications; a description of the intended purpose of the fill 
areas; and evidence that the proposed fill areas are the minimum necessary to achieve 
the intended purpose;

 (h)  Location, extent, and amount of the floodplain compensation area; and
 (i)  Existing and proposed alignment of any proposed alteration of a watercourse.

 (2)  The Floodplain Administrator is authorized to waive the submission of site 
plans, construction documents, and other data that are required by this chapter but that 
are not required to be prepared by a registered design professional if it is found that the 
nature of the proposed development is such that the review of such submissions is not 
necessary to ascertain compliance with this chapter.

 (B)  Information in flood hazard areas without base flood elevations 
(approximate Zone A). Where flood hazard areas are delineated on the FIRM and 
base flood elevation data have not been provided, the Floodplain Administrator shall:

 (1)  Obtain, review, and provide to applicants base flood elevation and 
floodway data available from a federal or state agency or other source or require 
the applicant to obtain and use base flood elevation and floodway data available 
from a federal or state agency or other source.; or Require the applicant to 
include base flood elevation data prepared in accordance with currently accepted 
engineering practices.

 (2)  Require the applicant to develop base flood elevation data prepared in 
accordance with currently accepted engineering practices; or Obtain, review, and 
provide to applicants base flood elevation and floodway data available from a 
federal or state agency or other source or require the applicant to obtain and use 
base flood elevation and floodway data available from a federal or state agency or 
other source.  

 (3)  Where base flood elevation and floodway data are not available from another 
source, the base flood elevation is three and one-half feet above the highest 
adjacent grade at the location of the development, provided there is no evidence 
indicating flood depths have been or may be greater than three and one-half feet.
where the available data are deemed by the Floodplain Administrator to not 
reasonably reflect flooding conditions, or where the available data are known to 
be scientifically or technically incorrect or otherwise inadequate:

a. Require the applicant to include base flood elevation data prepared in 
accordance with currently accepted engineering practices; or

b.  Specify that  the base flood elevation is three and one-half (3.5) feet 
above the highest adjacent grade at the location of the development, provided 
there is no evidence indicating flood depths have been or may be greater than 
three and one-half (3.5) feet.

 (4)  Where the base flood elevation data are to be used to support a Letter of Map 
Change from FEMA, advise the applicant that the analyses shall be prepared by a 
Florida licensed engineer in a format required by FEMA, and that it shall be the 



11

responsibility of the applicant to satisfy the submittal requirements and pay the 
processing fees.

 (C)  Additional analyses and certifications. As applicable to the location and 
nature of the proposed development activity, and in addition to the requirements of this 
section, the applicant shall have the following analyses signed and sealed by a Florida 
licensed engineer for submission with the site plan and construction documents:

 (1)  For development activities proposed to be located in a regulatory floodway, a 
floodway encroachment analysis that demonstrates that the encroachment of the 
proposed development will not cause any increase in base flood elevations; where the 
applicant proposes to undertake development activities that do increase base flood 
elevations, the applicant shall submit such analysis to FEMA as specified in § 152.05(D) 
of this chapter and shall submit the conditional letter of map revision, if issued by FEMA, 
with the site plan and construction documents;

 (2)  For development activities proposed to be located in a riverine flood hazard 
area for which base flood elevations are included in the flood insurance study or on the 
FIRM and floodways have not been designated, a floodway encroachment analysis
hydrological and hydraulic analyses which that demonstrates that the cumulative 
effect of the proposed development, when combined with all other existing and 
anticipated flood hazard area encroachments, will not increase the base flood elevation 
more than one foot at any point within the community. This requirement does not apply 
in isolated flood hazard areas not connected to a riverine flood hazard area or in flood 
hazard areas identified as Zone AO or Zone AH; and

 (3)  For alteration of a watercourse, an engineering analysis prepared in 
accordance with standard engineering practices which demonstrates that the flood-
carrying capacity of the altered or relocated portion of the watercourse will not be 
decreased, and certification that the altered watercourse shall be maintained in a 
manner which preserves the channel's flood-carrying capacity; the applicant shall 
submit the analysis to FEMA as specified in §152.05(D) of this chapter.

 (D)  Submission of additional data. When additional hydrologic, hydraulic or other 
engineering data, studies, and additional analyses are submitted to support an 
application, the applicant has the right to seek a letter of map change from FEMA to
change the base flood elevations, change floodway boundaries, or change boundaries 
of flood hazard areas shown on FIRMs, and to submit such data to FEMA for such 
purposes. The analyses shall be prepared by a Florida licensed engineer in a format 
required by FEMA. Submittal requirements and processing fees shall be the 
responsibility of the applicant.

§ 152.06 INSPECTIONS.

 (A)  General. Development for which a floodplain development permit or approval is 
required shall be subject to inspection.



12

 (B)  Development other than buildings and structures. The Floodplain 
Administrator shall inspect all development to determine compliance with the 
requirements of this chapter and the conditions of issued floodplain development 
permits or approvals.

 (C)  Buildings, structures and facilities exempt from the Florida Building Code. 
The Floodplain Administrator shall inspect buildings, structures and facilities exempt 
from the Florida Building Code to determine compliance with the requirements of this 
chapter and the conditions of issued floodplain development permits or approvals.

 (D)  Buildings, structures and facilities exempt from the Florida Building Code, 
lowest floor inspection. Upon placement of the lowest floor, including basement, and 
prior to further vertical construction, the owner of a building, structure or facility exempt 
from the Florida Building Code, or the owner's authorized agent, shall submit to the 
Floodplain Administrator:

 (1)  If a design flood elevation was used to determine the required elevation of the 
lowest floor, the certification of elevation of the lowest floor prepared and sealed by a 
Florida licensed professional surveyor; or

 (2)  If the elevation used to determine the required elevation of the lowest floor was 
determined in accordance with § 152.05(B)(3)(b) of this chapter, the documentation of 
height of the lowest floor above highest adjacent grade, prepared by the owner or the 
owner's authorized agent.

 (E)  Buildings, structures and facilities exempt from the Florida Building Code, 
final inspection. As part of the final inspection, the owner or owner's authorized agent 
shall submit to the Floodplain Administrator a final certification of elevation of the lowest 
floor or final documentation of the height of the lowest floor above the highest adjacent 
grade; such certifications and documentations shall be prepared as specified in 
§ 152.06(D) of this chapter.

 (F)  Manufactured homes. The Building Official shall inspect manufactured homes 
that are installed or replaced in flood hazard areas to determine compliance with the
requirements of this ordinance and the conditions of the issued permit. Upon placement 
of a manufactured home, certification of the elevation of the lowest floor shall be 
submitted to the Floodplain Administrator.

§ 152.07 VARIANCES AND APPEALS.

 (A)  General. The Board of Adjustment Planning & Zoning Board, as established 
by the city, shall hear and decide on requests for appeals and requests for variances 
from the strict application of this chapter. Pursuant to F.S. § 553.73(5), the Board of 
Adjustment shall hear and decide on requests for appeals and requests for variances 
from the strict application of the flood resistant construction requirements of the Florida 
Building Code.



13

 (B)  Appeals. The Board of Adjustment Planning & Zoning Board shall hear and 
decide appeals when it is alleged there is an error in any requirement, decision, or 
determination made by the Floodplain Administrator in the administration and 
enforcement of this chapter. Any person aggrieved by the decision of the Board of 
Adjustment Planning & Zoning Board may appeal such decision to the Circuit Court, 
as provided by Florida Statutes.

 (C)  Limitations on authority to grant variances. The Board of Adjustment
Planning & Zoning Board shall base its decisions on variances on technical 
justifications submitted by applicants, the considerations for issuance in § 152.07(G)of 
this chapter, the conditions of issuance set forth in § 152.07(H) of this chapter, and the 
comments and recommendations of the Floodplain Administrator and the Building 
Official. The Board of Adjustment Planning & Zoning Board has the right to attach 
such conditions as it deems necessary to further the purposes and objectives of this 
chapter.

 (D)  Restrictions in floodways. A variance shall not be issued for any proposed 
development in a floodway if any increase in base flood elevations would result, as 
evidenced by the applicable analyses and certifications required in § 152.05(C) of this 
chapter.

 (E)  Historic buildings. A variance is authorized to be issued for the repair, 
improvement, or rehabilitation of a historic building that is determined eligible for the 
exception to the flood resistant construction requirements of the Florida Building Code, 
Existing Building, Chapter 11 Historic Buildings, upon a determination that the proposed 
repair, improvement, or rehabilitation will not preclude the building's continued 
designation as a historic building and the variance is the minimum necessary to 
preserve the historic character and design of the building. If the proposed work 
precludes the building's continued designation as a historic building, a variance shall not 
be granted and the building and any repair, improvement, and rehabilitation shall be 
subject to the requirements of the Florida Building Code.

 (F)  Functionally dependent uses. A variance is authorized to be issued for the 
construction or substantial improvement necessary for the conduct of a functionally 
dependent use, as defined in this chapter, provided the variance meets the 
requirements of §152.07(D), is the minimum necessary considering the flood hazard, 
and all due consideration has been given to use of methods and materials that minimize 
flood damage during occurrence of the base flood.

 (G)  Considerations for issuance of variances. In reviewing requests for variances, 
the Board of Adjustment Planning & Zoning Board shall consider all technical 
evaluations, all relevant factors, all other applicable provisions of the Florida Building 
Code, this chapter, and the following:

 (1)  The danger that materials and debris may be swept onto other lands resulting 
in further injury or damage;



14

 (2)  The danger to life and property due to flooding or erosion damage;
 (3)  The susceptibility of the proposed development, including contents, to flood 

damage and the effect of such damage on current and future owners;
 (4)  The importance of the services provided by the proposed development to the

community;
 (5)  The availability of alternate locations for the proposed development that are 

subject to lower risk of flooding or erosion;
 (6)  The compatibility of the proposed development with existing and anticipated 

development;
  (7)  The relationship of the proposed development to the comprehensive plan and 

floodplain management program for the area;
 (8)  The safety of access to the property in times of flooding for ordinary and 

emergency vehicles;
 (9)  The expected heights, velocity, duration, rate of rise and debris and sediment 

transport of the floodwaters and the effects of wave action, if applicable, expected at the 
site; and

 (10)  The costs of providing governmental services during and after flood conditions 
including maintenance and repair of public utilities and facilities such as sewer, gas, 
electrical and water systems, streets and bridges.

 (H)  Conditions for issuance of variances. Variances shall be issued only upon:

 (1)  Submission by the applicant of a showing of good and sufficient cause that the 
unique characteristics of the size, configuration, or topography of the site limit 
compliance with any provision of this chapter or the required elevation standards;

 (2)  Determination by the Board of Adjustment Planning & Zoning Board that:
 (a)  Failure to grant the variance would result in exceptional hardship due to the 

physical characteristics of the land that render the lot undevelopable. Increased costs to 
satisfy the requirements or inconvenience do not constitute hardship;

 (b)  The granting of a variance will not result in increased flood heights, additional 
threats to public safety, extraordinary public expense, nor create nuisances, cause fraud 
on or victimization of the public, or conflict with existing local laws and ordinances; and

 (c)  The variance is the minimum necessary, considering the flood hazard, to 
afford relief;

 (3)  Receipt of a signed statement by the applicant that the variance, if granted, 
shall be recorded in the Office of the Clerk of the Court in such a manner that it appears 
in the chain of title of the affected parcel of land; and

 (4)  If the request is for a variance to allow construction of the lowest floor of a new 
building, or substantial improvement of a building, below the required elevation, a copy 
in the record of a written notice from the Floodplain Administrator to the applicant for the 
variance, specifying the difference between the base flood elevation and the proposed 
elevation of the lowest floor, stating that the cost of federal flood insurance will be 
commensurate with the increased risk resulting from the reduced floor elevation (up to 
amounts as high as $25 for $100 of insurance coverage), and stating that construction 
below the base flood elevation increases risks to life and property.



15

§ 152.08 VIOLATIONS.

 (A)  Violations.  Any development that is not within the scope of the Florida Building 
Code but that is regulated by this chapter that is performed without an issued permit, 
that is in conflict with an issued permit, or that does not fully comply with this chapter, 
shall be deemed a violation of this chapter. A building or structure without the 
documentation of elevation of the lowest floor, other required design certifications, or 
other evidence of compliance required by this chapter or the Florida Building Code is 
presumed to be a violation until such time as that documentation is provided.

 (B)  Authority. For development that is not within the scope of the Florida Building 
Code but that is regulated by this chapter and that is determined to be a violation, the 
Floodplain Administrator is authorized to serve notices of violation or stop work orders 
to owners of the property involved, to the owner's agent, or to the person or persons 
performing the work.

 (C)  Unlawful continuance. Any person who violates this chapter or fails to comply 
with any of its requirements shall, upon conviction thereof, be fined not more than $500 
or imprisoned for not more than 90 days, or both; and in addition, shall pay all costs and 
expenses involved in the case. Each day such violation continues shall be considered a 
separate offense. Nothing herein contained shall prevent the city from taking such other 
lawful action as is necessary to prevent or remedy any violation.

DEFINITIONS

§ 152.20 DEFINITIONS.
 Unless otherwise expressly stated, the following words and terms shall, for the 

purposes of this chapter have the meanings shown in this section. Where terms are not 
defined in this chapter and are defined in the Florida Building Code, such terms shall 
have the meanings ascribed to them in that code. Where terms are not defined in this 
chapter or the Florida Building Code, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted 
meanings such as the context implies.

 “ALTERATION OF A WATERCOURSE.” A dam, impoundment, channel relocation, 
change in channel alignment, channelization, or change in cross-sectional area of the 
channel or the channel capacity, or any other form of modification which may alter, 
impede, retard or change the direction and/or velocity of the riverine flow of water during 
conditions of the base flood.

 “APPEAL.” A request for a review of the Floodplain Administrator's interpretation of 
any provision of this chapter or a request for a variance.

 “ASCE 24.” A standard titled Flood Resistant Design and Construction that is 
referenced by the Florida Building Code. ASCE 24 is developed and published by the 
American Society of Civil Engineers, Reston, VA.



16

 “BASE FLOOD.” A flood having a 1% chance of being equaled or exceeded in any 
given year. [Also defined in FBC, B, Section 1612.2.] The base flood is commonly 
referred to as the "100-year flood" or the "1% annual chance flood."

 “BASE FLOOD ELEVATION.” The elevation of the base flood, including wave height, 
relative to the National Geodetic Vertical Datum (NGVD), North American Vertical 
Datum (NAVD) or other datum specified on the Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM).
[Also defined in FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 “BASEMENT.” The portion of a building having its floor subgrade (below ground level) 
on all sides. [Also defined in FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 “DESIGN FLOOD.” The flood associated with the greater of the following two areas: 
[Also defined in 35 FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 (1)  Area with a floodplain subject to a 1% or greater chance of flooding in any year; 
or

 (2)  Area designated as a flood hazard area on the community's flood hazard map, 
or otherwise legally designated.

 “DESIGN FLOOD ELEVATION.” The elevation of the "design flood," including wave 
height, relative to the datum specified on the community's legally designated flood 
hazard map. In areas designated as Zone AO, the design flood elevation shall be the 
elevation of the highest existing grade of the building's perimeter plus the depth number 
(in feet) specified on the flood hazard map. In areas designated as Zone AO where the 
depth number is not specified on the map, the depth number shall be taken as being 
equal to two feet. [Also defined in FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 “DEVELOPMENT.” Any man-made change to improved or unimproved real estate, 
including but not limited to, buildings or other structures, tanks, temporary structures, 
temporary or permanent storage of equipment or materials, mining, dredging, filling, 
grading, paving, excavations, drilling operations or any other land disturbing activities.

 “ENCROACHMENT.” The placement of fill, excavation, buildings, permanent 
structures or other development into a flood hazard area which may impede or alter the 
flow capacity of riverine flood hazard areas.

 “EXISTING BUILDING AND EXISTING STRUCTURE.” Any buildings and structures 
for which the "start of construction" commenced before March 18, 1980. [Also defined in 
FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 “EXISTING MANUFACTURED HOME PARK OR SUBDIVISION.” A manufactured 
home park or subdivision for which the construction of facilities for servicing the lots on 
which the manufactured homes are to be affixed (including, at a minimum, the 
installation of utilities, the construction of streets, and either final site grading or the 
pouring of concrete pads) is completed before March 18, 1980.



17

 “EXPANSION TO AN EXISTING MANUFACTURED HOME PARK OR 
SUBDIVISION.” The preparation of additional sites by the construction of facilities for 
servicing the lots on which the manufactured homes are to be affixed (including the 
installation of utilities, the construction of streets, and either final site grading or the 
pouring of concrete pads).

 “FEDERAL EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY (FEMA).” The federal agency 
that, in addition to carrying out other functions, administers the National Flood Insurance 
Program.

 “FLOOD OR FLOODING.” A general and temporary condition of partial or complete 
inundation of normally dry land from: [Also defined in FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 (1)  The overflow of inland or tidal waters.
 (2)  The unusual and rapid accumulation or runoff of surface waters from any 

source.

 “FLOOD DAMAGE-RESISTANT MATERIALS.” Any construction material capable of 
withstanding direct and prolonged contact with floodwaters without sustaining any 
damage that requires more than cosmetic repair. [Also defined in FBC, B, Section 
1612.2.]

 “FLOOD HAZARD AREA.” The greater of the following two areas: [Also defined in 
FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 (1)  The area within a floodplain subject to a 1% or greater chance of flooding in 
any year.

 (2)  The area designated as a flood hazard area on the community's flood hazard 
map, or otherwise legally designated.

 “FLOOD INSURANCE RATE MAP (FIRM).” The official map of the community on 
which the Federal Emergency Management Agency has delineated both special flood 
hazard areas and the risk premium zones applicable to the community. [Also defined in 
FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 “FLOOD INSURANCE STUDY (FIS).” The official report provided by the Federal 
Emergency Management Agency that contains the flood insurance rate map, the flood 
boundary and floodway map (if applicable), the water surface elevations of the base 
flood, and supporting technical data. [Also defined in FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 “FLOODPLAIN ADMINISTRATOR.” The office or position designated and charged 
with the administration and enforcement of this chapter (may be referred to as the 
Floodplain Manager).

 “FLOODPLAIN DEVELOPMENT PERMIT OR APPROVAL.” An official document or 
certificate issued by the community, or other evidence of approval or concurrence, 
which authorizes performance of specific development activities that are located in flood 
hazard areas and that are determined to be compliant with this chapter.



18

 “FLOODWAY.” The channel of a river or other riverine watercourse and the adjacent 
land areas that must be reserved in order to discharge the base flood without 
cumulatively increasing the water surface elevation more than a designated height.
one (1) foot.  [Also defined in FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 “FLOODWAY ENCROACHMENT ANALYSIS.” An engineering analysis of the impact 
that a proposed encroachment into a floodway is expected to have on the floodway 
boundaries and base flood elevations. The evaluation shall be prepared by a qualified 
Florida licensed engineer using standard engineering methods and models.

 “FLORIDA BUILDING CODE.” The family of codes adopted by the Florida Building 
Commission, including: Florida Building Code, Building; Florida Building Code, 
Residential; Florida Building Code, Existing Building; Florida Building Code, Mechanical; 
Florida Building Code, Plumbing; Florida Building Code, Fuel Gas.

 “FUNCTIONALLY DEPENDENT USE.” A use which cannot perform its intended 
purpose unless it is located or carried out in close proximity to water, including only 
docking facilities, port facilities that are necessary for the loading and unloading of cargo 
or passengers, and ship building and ship repair facilities. The term does not include 
long-term storage or related manufacturing facilities.

 “HIGHEST ADJACENT GRADE.” The highest natural elevation of the ground surface 
prior to construction next to the proposed walls or foundation of a structure.

 “HISTORIC STRUCTURE.” Any structure that is determined eligible for the exception 
to the flood hazard area requirements of the Florida Building Code, Existing Building, 
Chapter 11 Historic Buildings.

 “LETTER OF MAP CHANGE (LOMC).” An official determination issued by FEMA that 
amends or revises an effective flood insurance rate map or flood insurance study.
Letters of map change includes:

 (1)  “LETTER OF MAP AMENDMENT (LOMA).” An amendment based on technical 
data showing that a property was incorrectly included in a designated special flood 
hazard area. A LOMA amends the current effective flood insurance rate map and 
establishes that a specific property, portion of a property, or structure is not located in a 
special flood hazard area.

 (2)  “LETTER OF MAP REVISION (LOMR).” A revision based on technical data 
that may show changes to flood zones, flood elevations, special flood hazard area 
boundaries and floodway delineations, and other planimetric features.

 (3)  “LETTER OF MAP REVISION BASED ON FILL (LOMR-F).” A determination 
that a structure or parcel of land has been elevated by fill above the base flood elevation 
and is, therefore, no longer located within the special flood hazard area. In order to 
qualify for this determination, the fill must have been permitted and placed in 
accordance with the community's floodplain management regulations.



19

 (4)  “CONDITIONAL LETTER OF MAP REVISION (CLOMR).” A formal review and 
comment as to whether a proposed flood protection project or other project complies 
with the minimum NFIP requirements for such projects with respect to delineation of 
special flood hazard areas. A CLOMR does not revise the effective flood insurance rate 
map or flood insurance study. Upon submission and approval of certified as-built 
documentation, a letter of map revision may be issued by FEMA to revise the effective 
FIRM.

 “LIGHT-DUTY TRUCK.” As defined in 40 C.F.R. 86.082-2, any motor vehicle rated at 
8,500 pounds gross vehicular weight rating or less which has a vehicular curb weight of 
6,000 pounds or less and which has a basic vehicle frontal area of 45 square feet or 
less, which is:

 (1)  Designed primarily for purposes of transportation of property or is a derivation 
of such a vehicle, or

 (2)  Designed primarily for transportation of persons and has a capacity of more 
than 12 persons; or

 (3)  Available with special features enabling off-street or off-highway operation and 
use.

 “LOWEST FLOOR.” The lowest floor of the lowest enclosed area of a building or 
structure, including basement, but excluding any unfinished or flood-resistant enclosure, 
other than a basement, usable solely for vehicle parking, building access or limited 
storage provided that such enclosure is not built so as to render the structure in violation 
of the non-elevation requirements of the Florida Building Code or ASCE 24. [Also 
defined in FBC, B, Section 1612.2.]

 “MANUFACTURED HOME.” A structure, transportable in one or more sections, which 
is eight (8) feet or more in width and greater than 400 square feet, and which is built on 
a permanent, integral chassis and is designed for use with or without a permanent 
foundation when attached to the required utilities. The term "MANUFACTURED HOME" 
does not include a "RECREATIONAL VEHICLE" or "PARK TRAILER." [Also defined in 
15C-1.0101, F.A.C.]

 “MANUFACTURED HOME PARK OR SUBDIVISION.” A parcel (or contiguous 
parcels) of land divided into two or more manufactured home lots for rent or sale.

 “MARKET VALUE.” The price at which a property will change hands between a willing 
buyer and a willing seller, neither party being under compulsion to buy or sell and both 
having reasonable knowledge of relevant facts. As used in this chapter the term refers 
to the market value of buildings and structures, excluding the land and other 
improvements on the parcel. Market value may be established by a qualified 
independent appraiser, actual cash value (replacement cost depreciated for age and 
quality of construction), or tax assessment value adjusted to approximate market value 
by a factor provided by the property appraiser.



20

 “NEW CONSTRUCTION.” For the purposes of administration of this chapter and the 
flood resistant construction requirements of the Florida Building Code, structures for 
which the "start of construction" commenced on or after March 18, 1980 and includes 
any subsequent improvements to such structures.

 “NEW MANUFACTURED HOME PARK OR SUBDIVISION.” A manufactured home 
park or subdivision for which the construction of facilities for servicing the lots on which 
the manufactured homes are to be affixed (including at a minimum, the installation of 
utilities, the construction of streets, and either final site grading or the pouring of 
concrete pads) is completed on or after March 18, 1980.

 “PARK TRAILER.” A transportable unit which has a body width not exceeding 14 feet 
and which is built on a single chassis and is designed to provide seasonal or temporary 
living quarters when connected to utilities necessary for operation of installed fixtures 
and appliances. [Defined in 15C-1.0101, F.A.C. Section 320.01 F.S.]

 “RECREATIONAL VEHICLE.” A vehicle, including a park trailer, which is: [Defined 
inSee F.S. § 320.01(b) F.S.]

 (1)  Built on a single chassis;
 (2)  Four hundred square feet or less when measured at the largest horizontal 

projection;
 (3)  Designed to be self-propelled or permanently towable by a light-duty truck; and
 (4)  Designed primarily not for use as a permanent dwelling but as temporary living 

quarters for recreational, camping, travel, or seasonal use.

 “SPECIAL FLOOD HAZARD AREA.” An area in the floodplain subject to a 1% or 
greater chance of flooding in any given year. Special flood hazard areas are shown on 
FIRMs as Zone A, AO, A1-A30, AE, A99, AH, V1-V30, VE or V. [Also defined in FBC, B 
Section 1612.2.]

 “START OF CONSTRUCTION.” The date of issuance for new construction and 
substantial improvements to existing structures, provided the actual start of 
construction, repair, reconstruction, rehabilitation, addition, placement, or other 
improvement is within 180 days of the date of the issuance. The actual start of 
construction means either the first placement of permanent construction of abuilding 
(including a manufactured home) on a site, such as the pouring of slab or footings, the 
installation of piles, the construction of columns. Permanent construction does not 
include land preparation (such as clearing, grading, or filling), the installation of streets 
or walkways, excavation for a basement, footings, piers, or foundations, the erection of 
temporary forms or the installation of accessory buildings such as garages or sheds not 
occupied as dwelling units or not part of the main buildings. For a substantial 
improvement, the actual "start of construction" means the first alteration of any wall, 
ceiling, floor or other structural part of a building, whether or not that alteration affects 
the external dimensions of the building. [Also defined in FBC, B Section 1612.2.]



21

 “SUBSTANTIAL DAMAGE.” Damage of any origin sustained by a building or structure 
whereby the cost of restoring the building or structure to its before-damaged condition 
would equal or exceed 40% of the market value of the building or structure before the 
damage occurred. [Also defined in FBC, B Section 1612.2.]

 “SUBSTANTIAL IMPROVEMENT.” Any combination of repair, reconstruction, 
rehabilitation, addition or improvement of a building or structure taking place during a 
ten-year period, the cumulative cost of which equals or exceeds 40% of the market 
value of the structure before the improvement or repair is started. For each building or 
structure, the ten-year period begins on the date of the first improvement or repair of 
that building or structure subsequent to the effective date of this chapter. If the structure 
has sustained substantial damage, any repairs are considered substantial improvement 
regardless of the actual repair work performed. The term does not, however, include 
either:

 (1)  Any project for improvement of a building required to correct existing health, 
sanitary or safety code violations identified by the Building Official and that are the 
minimum necessary to assure safe living conditions.

 (2)  Any alteration of a historic structure provided that the alteration will not preclude 
the structure's continued designation as a historic structure.

 “VARIANCE.” A grant of relief from the requirements of this chapter, or the flood 
resistant construction requirements of the Florida Building Code, which permits 
construction in a manner that would not otherwise be permitted by this chapter or the 
Florida Building Code.

 “WATERCOURSE.” A river, creek, stream, channel or other topographic feature in, 
on, through, or over which water flows at least periodically.

FLOOD RESISTANT DEVELOPMENT

§ 152.35 BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES.

 Design and construction of buildings, structures and facilities exempt from the Florida 
Building Code. Pursuant to § 152.04(C) of this chapter, buildings, structures, and 
facilities that are exempt from the Florida Building Code, including substantial 
improvement or repair of substantial damage of such buildings, structures and facilities, 
shall be designed and constructed in accordance with the flood load and flood resistant 
construction requirements of ASCE 24. Structures exempt from the Florida Building 
Code that are not walled and roofed buildings shall comply with the requirements of 
§ 152.41 of this chapter.

§ 152.36 SUBDIVISIONS.

 (A)  Minimum requirements. Subdivision proposals, including proposals for 
manufactured home parks and subdivisions, shall be reviewed to determine that:



22

 (1)  Such proposals are consistent with the need to minimize flood damage and will 
be reasonably safe from flooding;

 (2)  All public utilities and facilities such as sewer, gas, electric, communications, 
and water systems are located and constructed to minimize or eliminate flood damage; 
and

 (3)  Adequate drainage is provided to reduce exposure to flood hazards in Zones 
AH and AO, adequate drainage paths shall be provided to guide floodwaters 
around and away from proposed structures.
 
 (B)  Subdivision plats. Where any portion of proposed subdivisions, including 

manufactured home parks and subdivisions, lies within a flood hazard area, the 
following shall be required:

 (1)  Delineation of flood hazard areas, floodway boundaries and flood zones, and 
design flood elevations, as appropriate, shall be shown on preliminary plats and final 
plats;

 (2)  Where the subdivision has more than 50 lots or is larger than five acres and 
base flood elevations are not included on the FIRM, the base flood elevations 
determined in accordance with §152.05(B)(1) or (2) of this chapter; and

 (3)  Compliance with the site improvement and utilities requirements of § 152.37 of 
this chapter.

§ 152.37 SITE IMPROVEMENTS, UTILITIES AND LIMITATIONS.

 (A)  Minimum requirements. All proposed new development shall be reviewed to 
determine that:

 (1)  Such proposals are consistent with the need to minimize flood damage and will 
be reasonably safe from flooding;

 (2)  All public utilities and facilities such as sewer, gas, electric, communications, 
and water systems are located and constructed to minimize or eliminate flood damage; 
and

 (3)  Adequate drainage is provided to reduce exposure to flood hazards in Zones 
AH and AO, adequate drainage paths shall be provided to guide floodwaters 
around and away from proposed structures.

 (B)  Sanitary sewage facilities. All new and replacement sanitary sewage facilities, 
private sewage treatment plants (including all pumping stations and collector systems), 
and on-site waste disposal systems shall be designed in accordance with the standards 
for onsite sewage treatment and disposal systems in Chapter 64E-6, F.A.C. and ASCE 
24 Chapter 7 to minimize or eliminate infiltration of floodwaters into the facilities and 
discharge from the facilities into flood waters, and impairment of the facilities and 
systems.

 (C)  Water supply facilities. All new and replacement water supply facilities shall be 
designed in accordance with the water well construction standards in Chapter 62-



23

532.500, F.A.C. and ASCE 24 Chapter 7 to minimize or eliminate infiltration of 
floodwaters into the systems.

 (D)  Limitations on sites in regulatory floodways. No development, including but 
not limited to site improvements, and land disturbing activity involving fill or regrading 
shall be authorized in the regulatory floodway unless the floodway encroachment 
analysis required in Section 105.3(1) of this chapter demonstrates that the proposed 
development or land disturbing activity will not result in any increase in the base flood 
elevation.

 (E)  Limitations on placement of fill. Subject to the limitations of this chapter, fill 
shall be designed to be stable under conditions of flooding including rapid rise and rapid 
drawdown of floodwaters, prolonged inundation, and protection against flood-related 
erosion and scour. In addition to these requirements, if intended to support buildings 
and structures (Zone A only), fill shall comply with the requirements of the Florida 
Building Code.

§ 152.38 MANUFACTURED HOMES.

 (A)  General. All manufactured homes installed in flood hazard areas shall be 
installed by an installer that is licensed pursuant to F.S. § 320.8249, and shall comply 
with the requirements of Chapter 15C-1, F.A.C. and the requirements of this chapter.

 (B)  Foundations. All new manufactured homes and replacement manufactured 
homes installed in flood hazard areas shall be installed on permanent, reinforced 
foundations that are designed in accordance with the foundation requirements of the 
Florida Building Code Residential Section R322.2 and this ordinance.

 (C)  Anchoring. All new manufactured homes and replacement manufactured homes 
shall be installed using methods and practices which minimize flood damage and shall 
be securely anchored to an adequately anchored foundation system to resist flotation, 
collapse or lateral movement. Methods of anchoring include, but are not limited to, use 
of over-the-top or frame ties to ground anchors. This anchoring requirement is in 
addition to applicable state and local anchoring requirements for wind resistance.

 (D)  Elevation. Manufactured homes that are placed, replaced, or substantially 
improved shall comply with § 152.38(D)(1) and (2) of this chapter, as applicable.

 (1)  General elevation requirement. Unless subject to the requirements of 
§ 152.38(D)(2) below of this chapter, all manufactured homes that are placed, replaced, 
or substantially improved on sites located:

 (a)  Outside of a manufactured home park or subdivision;
 (b)  In a new manufactured home park or subdivision;
 (c)  In an expansion to an existing manufactured home park or subdivision; or
 (d)  In an existing manufactured home park or subdivision upon which a 

manufactured home has incurred "substantial damage" as the result of a flood, shall be 



24

elevated such that the bottom of the frame is at or above the elevation required, as 
applicable to the flood hazard area, in the Florida Building Code, Residential Section 
R322.2 (Zone A).

 (2)  Elevation requirement for certain existing manufactured home parks and 
subdivisions. Manufactured homes that are not subject to § 152.38(D)(1) of this chapter, 
including manufactured homes that are placed, replaced, or substantially improved on 
sites located in an existing manufactured home park or subdivision, unless on a site 
where substantial damage as result of flooding has occurred, shall be elevated such 
that either the:

 (a)  Bottom of the frame of the manufactured home is at or above the elevation 
required in the Florida Building Code, Residential Section R322.2 (Zone A); or

 (b)  Bottom of the frame is supported by reinforced piers or other foundation 
elements of at least equivalent strength that are not less than 36 inches in height above 
grade.

 (E)  Enclosures. Fully eEnclosed areas below elevated manufactured homes shall 
comply with the requirements of the Florida Building Code, Residential Section R322 for 
such enclosed areas.

 (F)  Utility equipment. Utility equipment that serves manufactured homes, including 
electric, heating, ventilation, plumbing, and air conditioning equipment and other service 
facilities, shall comply with the requirements of the Florida Building Code, Residential 
Section R322.

§ 152.39 RECREATIONAL VEHICLES AND PARK TRAILERS.

 (A)  Temporary placement. Recreational vehicles and park trailers placed 
temporarily in flood hazard areas shall:

 (1)  Be on the site for fewer than 180 consecutive days; or
 (2)  Be fully licensed and ready for highway use, which means the recreational 

vehicle or park model is on wheels or jacking system, is attached to the site only by 
quick-disconnect type utilities and security devices, and has no permanent attachments 
such as additions, rooms, stairs, decks and porches.

 (B)  Permanent placement. Recreational vehicles and park trailers that do not meet 
the limitations in § 152.39(A) of this ordinance for temporary placement shall meet the 
requirements of §152.38 of this chapter for manufactured homes.

§ 152.40 TANKS.

 (A)  Underground tanks. Underground tanks in flood hazard areas shall be 
anchored to prevent flotation, collapse or lateral movement resulting from hydrodynamic 
and hydrostatic loads during conditions of the design flood, including the effects of 
buoyancy assuming the tank is empty.



25

 (B)  Above-ground tanks, not elevated. Above-ground tanks that do not meet the 
elevation requirements of § 152.40(C) of this chapter shall be permitted in flood hazard 
areas provided the tanks are anchored or otherwise designed and constructed to 
prevent flotation, collapse or lateral movement resulting from hydrodynamic and 
hydrostatic loads during conditions of the design flood, including the effects of buoyancy 
assuming the tank is empty and the effects of flood-borne debris.

 (C)  Above-ground tanks, elevated. Above-ground tanks in flood hazard areas shall 
be attached to and elevated to or above the design flood elevation on a supporting 
structure that is designed to prevent flotation, collapse or lateral movement during 
conditions of the design flood. Tank-supporting structures shall meet the foundation 
requirements of the applicable flood hazard area.

(C) Tank inlets and vents. Tank inlets, fill openings, outlets and vents shall be:

 (1)  At or above the design flood elevation or fitted with covers designed to prevent 
the inflow of floodwater or outflow of the contents of the tanks during conditions of the 
design flood; and

 (2)  Anchored to prevent lateral movement resulting from hydrodynamic and 
hydrostatic loads, including the effects of buoyancy, during conditions of the design 
flood.

§ 152.41 OTHER DEVELOPMENT.

 (A)  General requirements for other development. All development, including man-
made changes to improved or unimproved real estate for which specific provisions are 
not specified in this chapter or the Florida Building Code, shall:

 (1)  Be located and constructed to minimize flood damage;
 (2)  Meet the limitations of § 152.37(D) of this chapter if located in a regulated 

floodway;
 (3)  Be anchored to prevent flotation, collapse or lateral movement resulting from 

hydrostatic loads, including the effects of buoyancy, during conditions of the design 
flood;

 (4)  Be constructed of flood damage-resistant materials;
 (5)  Have a minimum finished floor elevation 1.5 feet above the base flood 

elevation; and
 (6)  Have mechanical, plumbing, and electrical systems above the design flood 

elevation, except that minimum electric service required to address life safety and 
electric code requirements is permitted below the design flood elevation provided it 
conforms to the provisions of the electrical part of building code for wet locations.

 (B)  Fences in regulated floodways. Fences in regulated floodways that have the 
potential to block the passage of floodwaters, such as stockade fences and wire mesh 
fences, shall meet the limitations of § 152.37(D) of this chapter.



26

 (C)  Retaining walls, sidewalks and driveways in regulated floodways. Retaining 
walls and sidewalks and driveways that involve the placement of fill in regulated 
floodways shall meet the limitations of § 152.37(D) of this chapter.

 (D)  Roads and watercourse crossings in regulated floodways. Roads and 
watercourse crossings, including roads, bridges, culverts, low-water crossings and 
similar means for vehicles or pedestrians to travel from one side of a watercourse to the 
other side, that encroach into regulated floodways shall meet the limitations of 
§ 152.37(D)of this chapter. Alteration of a watercourse that is part of a road or 
watercourse crossing shall meet the requirements of § 152.05(C)(3) of this chapter.

Section 2.  Severability.  In the event that any portion or section of this 

Ordinance is determined to be invalid, illegal or unconstitutional by a court of competent 

jurisdiction, such decision shall in no manner affect the remaining portions or sections of 

this Ordinance, which shall remain in full force and effect.

Section 3: Conflicts.  All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict with this 

Ordinance are hereby repealed.  

Section 4. Codification.  It is the intention of the City Commission that the 

provisions of this Ordinance shall become and be made part of the Code of Ordinances of 

the City of Lake Mary, Florida and the word “ordinance” may be changed to “section”, 

“article”, or other appropriate word or phrase and the sections of this Ordinance may be 

renumbered or re-lettered to accomplish such intention.  

Section 5:  Effective date.  This ordinance shall become effective immediately 

upon passage and adoption.

PASSED AND ADOPTED this ______ day of _______________________, 

2014.

FIRST READING: ______________________________

SECOND READING:  ____________________________



27

Attest:

____________________________  _______________________
CAROL A. FOSTER, CITY CLERK   DAVID J. MEALOR, MAYOR

For use and reliance of the City of Lake
Mary only.  Approved as to form and legality.

______________________________                                                                   
CATHERINE D. REISCHMANN, CITY ATTORNEY



CITY MANAGER’S REPORT

DATE: December 4, 2014

TO: Mayor and City Commission

FROM: Jackie Sova, City Manager

SUBJECT: City Manager's Report

ITEMS FOR COMMISSION ACTION:

1. Final Design Plan for SunRail Entry Feature.  

2. Vehicle and Equipment Replacements for FY 2015; and New Vehicle for New Police 
Sergeant.  

3. Computer Purchases and Surplus.



CITY MANAGER’S REPORT

DATE: December 4, 2014

TO: Mayor and City Commission

FROM: Stephen Noto, Senior Planner

THRU: John Omana, Community Development Director

VIA: Jackie Sova, City Manager

SUBJECT: Final Design Plan for SunRail Entry Feature Sign

BACKGROUND: On November 20, 2014, staff updated the City Commission on the 
SunRail Entry Feature Sign that is part of the SunRail Enhancement Projects. Based on 
the four options presented, staff was directed to bring a final design back that was more 
similar to the monument sign at Trailhead Park (i.e. more curves, more dimensional 
aspects). 

Attached, for reference, is a photo of the Trailhead Park sign. Additionally, FASTSIGNS 
has prepared new designs based upon the City Commission’s direction that will be 
presented at the December 4th meeting (they are not included in this memo due to the 
short turn-around time, and holiday week).

REQUEST: Staff is requesting that the City Commission direct staff to move forward 
with purchase and design of the monument sign.  Final installation will not occur until 
the City completes its infrastructure improvements on N. Palmetto St. (i.e. traffic signal, 
right-turn lane, lift station, etc.)   

ATTACHMENTS:
• Photo of Trailhead Park Sign





CITY MANAGER’S REPORT

DATE: December 4, 2014

TO: Mayor and City Commission

FROM: Bruce Paster, P.E., Director of Public Works

VIA: Jackie Sova, City Manager

SUBJECT: Vehicle and Equipment Replacements for FY 2015; and New Vehicle for 
New Police Sergeant

DISCUSSION: The FY 2015 budget includes the replacement of:
3 – Public Works vehicles;
2 – Public Works mowers;
1 – Public Works equipment trailer;
1 – Parks & Recreation vehicle;
4 – Parks & Recreation mowers/work carts;
2 – Fire Prevention vehicles; and
3 – Police vehicles.

Below is a description of each new item along with the item it replaces.  Please see 
attached quotes for additional details. 

PUBLIC WORKS

1. 2015 Ford F-450 Crane Work Truck
F-450 Crane Work Truck under FSA bid #14-22-0904 through Duval Ford: 
$67,146.00; Dana Safety Supply lighting and equipment: $2,164.00; Southern 
Custom Creations decals: $150.00.  Total cost of replacement is $69,460.00.  
This vehicle will replace a 2004 F-550 Crane Truck.



2. 2015 Caterpillar CT660 Dump Truck
CT660 Dump Truck under FSA bid #14-22-0904 through Ring Power Fleet 
Sales: $132,719.00 (after $16,500 trade-in value of 1997 dump truck); Dana 
Safety Supply lighting and equipment: $1,698.00; Southern Custom Creations 
decals: $150.00.  Total cost of replacement is $134,567.00.  This vehicle will 
replace a 1997 Ford Dump Truck.

3. 2015 Ford F-250 Utility Truck
F-250 Utility Truck under FSA bid #14-22-0904 through Duval Ford: $34,607.00; 
Dana Safety Supply lighting and equipment: $4,995.00; Southern Custom 
Creations decals: $150.00.  Total cost of replacement is $39,752.00.  This 
vehicle will replace a 1999 F-250.

4. 60” Toro Zero-Turn Mower (Typical of 2)
25 hp rear discharge EFI fuel efficient mower under State Contract #760-000-10-
1 through Lake Mary Lawn & Garden: $9,279.36 each.  These mowers will 
replace a 2005 and 2006 Toro Grounds Master.

5. Equipment Trailer
Custom built 18’ x 7’ Equipment Trailer from Blue & Grey Trailer MFG., Sanford: 
$7,500.  This trailer will replace a 2000 Crosley Tandem trailer.

PARKS AND RECREATION

1. 2015 Ford F-150 Crew Cab Pick-up Truck 
F-150 Crew Cab pick-up 4x4 under FSA bid #14-22-0904 through Duval Ford: 
$28,704.00; Dana Safety Supply lighting and equipment: $1,714.65; Southern 
Custom Creations decals: $150.00.  Total cost of replacement is $30,568.65.  
This vehicle will replace a 2007 F-150.

2. Workman Heavy Duty Utility Vehicle
Workman HDX with attachments and appurtenances under State Contract #760-
000-10-1 through Wesco Turf: $35,752.62.  This will replace a 2006 Toro 
Workman Cart.

3. Workman Mid Duty Utility Vehicle
Workman MD CARB with appurtenances under State Contract #760-000-10-1 
through Wesco Turf: $8,387.43.  This will replace a 2005 Clubcar Turf golf cart.

4. 52” Toro Zero-Turn Mower
25 HP Kohler Command Pro EFI fuel efficient mower under State Contract #760-
000-10-1 through Wesco Turf: $7,972.26.  This will replace a 2009 Toro Z-500 
52” Master Mower.



5. 60” Toro Zero-Turn Mower
25 HP Kohler Command Pro EFI fuel efficient mower under State Contract #760-
000-10-1 through Wesco Turf: $8,509.08.  This will replace a 2009 Toro Z-500 
60” Master Mower.

FIRE PREVENTION

1. 2015 Ford F-150 Pick-up Truck (Typical of 2)
F150 4x2 Pick-up under FSA bid #14-22-0904 through Duval Ford: $21,851; 
Dana Safety Supply lighting, equipment and decals: $4,652.50.  Total cost of 
replacement is $26,503.50 each.  These vehicles will replace a 2008 Ford 
Ranger and a 2008 Ford Explorer.

POLICE DEPARTMENT

1. 2015 Ford Explorer Interceptor (Typical of 2)
Full size marked utility vehicle w/Police package under FSA bid #14-22-0904 
through Duval Ford: $25,817.00; Dana Safety Supply lighting, equipment and 
decals: $11,014.20; Digital Ally Camera System: $4,224.00.  Total cost of 
replacement is $41,055.20 each.  These vehicles will replace two 2010 Chevy 
Impalas.

2. 2015 Ford Explorer Interceptor K-9
Full size marked utility vehicle w/Police K-9 package under FSA bid #14-22-0904 
through Duval Ford: $32,083.00; Dana Safety Supply lighting, equipment and 
decals: $14,011.98; Digital Ally Camera System: $4,224.00.  Total cost of 
replacement is $50,318.98.  This vehicle will replace a 2010 Ford Crown Victoria 
K-9.

Note: all Dana Safety Supply equipment will be purchased under City of Tallahassee 
contract #1489, RFP #0233-06-BM-TC.

Summary

Vehicles to be replaced: Replacement vehicles (2015):
1. #66 - 04 Ford F-550 Crane Truck Ford F-450 Crane Truck
2. #40 - 97 Ford Dump Truck Caterpillar CT660 Dump Truck
3. #49 - 99 Ford F-250 Ford F-250 Utility Truck 
4. #532 - 05 Toro Grounds Master Toro Zero-Turn Mower
5. #536 - 06 Toro Grounds Master Toro Zero-Turn Mower
6. #515 - 00 Crosley Tandem Trailer Equipment Trailer
7. #543 - 07 Ford F-150 Ford F-150 Crew Cab 
8. #535 - 06 Toro Workman Cart Workman Heavy Duty Utility Vehicle
9. #559 - 05 Clubcar Golf Cart Workman Mid Duty Utility Vehicle
10.#551 - 09 Toro Master Mower Toro Zero-Turn Mower 
11.#552 - 09 Toro Master Mower Toro Zero-Turn Mower 



Vehicles to be replaced: Replacement vehicles (2015):
12.#328 - 08 Ford Ranger Ford F-150 Pick-up Truck
13.#356 - 08 Ford Explorer Ford F-150 Pick-up Truck 
14.#2252 - 10 Chevy Impala Marked Ford Explorer Interceptor
15.#2253 - 10 Chevy Impala Marked Ford Explorer Interceptor
16.#2254 - 10 Ford Crown Vic K-9 Ford Explorer Interceptor K-9

The total cost of the 16 replacement vehicles with appurtenances is $546,464.14.  
Funding for this purchase was approved in the vehicle replacement budget in the 
amount of $574,400.  We are also requesting that the vehicles listed in the above 
summary be declared surplus.

Vehicle #2254 will be used to replace an older spare K-9 vehicle currently in our fleet.  
We are also requesting to declare the older vehicle, Unit #2228, surplus.  

   

In addition to the replacement vehicles described above the FY 2015 budget includes 
the purchase of a new vehicle out of the Police Impact Fees Fund for our new Police 
Sergeant as described below.

2015 Ford F-150 Crew Cab Pick-up Truck 
F-150 Crew Cab pick-up 4x2 under FSA bid #14-22-0904 through Duval Ford: 
$25,302.00; Dana Safety Supply lighting and equipment: $5,283.35.  Total cost of 
vehicle is $30,585.35.  

RECOMMENDATION: City Commission authorize the purchase of six (6) new 
Public Works vehicles, five (5) new Parks and Recreation vehicles, two (2) new Fire 
Department vehicles, and four (4) new Police vehicles under FSA bid #14-22-0904; 
purchase appurtenances as described above; surplus vehicles #40, #49, #66, #328, 
#356, #515, #532, #535, #536, #543, #551, #552, #559, #2228, #2252, and #2253, and 
authorize City Manager to dispose of same.





































































































































CITY MANAGER’S REPORT

DATE: December 4, 2014

TO: Mayor and City Commission

FROM: Dianne Holloway, Finance Director

VIA: Jackie Sova, City Manager

SUBJECT: Computer Purchases and Surplus

We are in the process of ordering computer replacements as budgeted for FY 2015. We will 
purchase (30) desktops and twelve (12) laptops. During this process we will shift some of 
the older computers to areas where the usage is less intense but the systems are still 
functioning well.

Computers being replaced are beyond or at the end of their useful lives and need to be 
surplused. Currently, we have 33 desktops that are operating on Windows XP and Microsoft 
is no longer supporting that operating system.  Additionally, we have 14 laptops that are not 
functioning properly due to extended periods of time operating in police vehicles.

Recommendation:

Request Commission authorize purchase of Dell computers in an amount not to exceed 
$48,345, declare forty-seven (47) asset tag numbers below as surplus items, and authorize 
City Manager to dispose of same.

Surplus Item Asset Tag Numbers:

10541 10774 10849 10873 10907 10870 10906 10993 10980 10985
10489 10775 10854 10871 10909 10917 10908 10987 10989 10992
10847 10779 10856 10872 10874 10916 10976 10988 10982
10972 10852 10846 10920 10914 10912 10806 10986 10990
10782 10855 10863 10903 10911 10913 10886 10995 10991


	Agenda Outline
	Item 5 - Attachment # 1 - 112014CC.min
	Item 8A - Agenda Memos
	Item 8A - Attachment # 1 - Floodplain14
	Item 11 - Agenda Memos
	Item 11.A.a - Agenda Memos
	Item 11.A.a - Attachment # 1
	Item 11.A.b - Agenda Memos
	Item 11.A.b - Attachment # 1
	Item 11.A.c - Agenda Memos

